
Bidder Vendor Name Engine 3 Engine 6 Engine 7 Engine 8 Engine 9 Engine 11 Engine 17 Engine 21 Engine 23 Engine 24 Engine 25 Engine 31 Engine 32
1 Capital Builders and Associates 130,464.39$    295,213.37$    NO BID 227,005.00$    NO BID 227,005.00$    NO BID 168,654.22$    NO BID 364,974.63$    168,654.22$    NO BID NO BID
2 Nationwide Electrical Services 407,601.03$    574,404.93$    413,937.08$    512,870.99$    471,106.50$    533,150.15$    448,755.75$    501,258.40$    509,142.05$    807,729.02$    469,678.89$    493,435.74$    459,586.39$    
3 ADP Group Inc 242,287.86$    565,445.62$    304,390.57$    428,704.00$    301,767.46$    431,704.00$    278,280.96$    301,767.46$    301,767.46$    720,290.22$    301,767.46$    301,767.46$    301,767.46$    
4 Chiaramonte 235,200.00$    398,200.00$    318,200.00$    317,200.00$    323,200.00$    338,200.00$    296,700.00$    303,200.00$    301,200.00$    458,200.00$    303,200.00$    303,200.00$    303,200.00$    
5 City Construction LLC 443,636.88$    636,873.88$    329,908.98$    556,418.50$    468,847.50$    184,222.50$    184,222.50$    468,811.60$    468,847.50$    703,776.43$    468,847.50$    468,847.50$    468,847.50$    
6 BLUE SKYE NO BID NO BID 167,291.13$    NO BID 202,385.06$    272,406.00$    183,742.41$    202,385.06$    202,385.06$    228,666.00$    NO BID 202,385.06$    202,385.06$    
7 THIHA NO BID NO BID NO BID 328,116.87$    NO BID 320,616.87$    NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 280,469.87$    NO BID

BID TABULATION: Generator Replacement at Various FEMS Engine Houses projects with solicitation number DCAM-23-CS-IFB-0013
Bid Opening: January 17, 2024 at 3:30PM
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